
 

EDUCATION 

 Bachelor of Science, Occupational Therapy, Queens 

University, Kingston, ON  (1995)  

SERVICES 

 In-Home Assessments & Treatment 

 Assessment of Attendant Care Needs – Form 1 

 Hospital Discharge Planning  & Coordination  

 Ergonomic Assessments  

 Physical Demands Analysis / Job Site Analysis 

 Cognitive Demands Analysis  

 Acquired Brain Injury Assessment & Treatment 

 Job Coaching 

AREAS OF PRACTICE 

 Acquired Brain Injury 

 Spinal Cord 

 Musculoskeletal/Soft Tissue 

 Orthopaedics 

 Geriatrics 

 Paediatrics 

 Chronic Pain 

CHANTAL 

PRASAD 

BScOT, OT Reg (Ont) 

                    Chantal completed her Bachelor of Science, 
Occupational Therapy at Queen’s University, in Kingston, ON, 
in 1995.  Prior to joining DMARehability in 1999, Chantal 
provided various occupational therapy support services to the 
geriatric population, in both Nursing Homes and Convalescent 
Care Centers, in Michigan, USA.  Chantal’s  combined 
academic achievements, ongoing passion for learning, 
professional experience have provided her with the 
opportunity to gain valuable knowledge and insight assisting 
individuals who have sustained serious, complex injuries 
including; neurological, orthopedic and soft tissue.  She is also 
Bilingual (English/French). In 2011, Chantal was trained in the 
Progressive Goal Attainment Program (PGAP), assisting 
individuals in returning to the workforce.  In 2018, she 
participated in the Concussion Management Workshop Level 
2, presented by Parkwood Hospital Outpatient Brain Injury 
Program and in 2019, she received her Certification: OBIA 
Level 1 Children and Youth with Acquired Brain Injury from 
the Ontario Brain Injury Association.  For many years Chantal 
was a valuable and dedicated Board Member, for OBIA, 
Sarnia Chapter.  She continues to provide compassionate and 
voluntary support to this Chapter.    

 

CHANTAL’S SERVICE AREAS 

 

HEAD OFFICE: 

1151 Florence Street, Suite 300 

London, Ontario N5W 2M7 

Phone: (519) 452-0046 

Fax: (519) 452-1413 

Toll-Free: 1-(866) 309-0046 

info@dmarehab.com 

 

 

For more information, please visit: 

WWW.DMAREHABILITY.COM 


